Bid Tabulation Sheet - RFQ #JLSG0612

1506 East Raynell 3,600(sq. ft.
Springfield, Missouri
Vendor Name Original | First | Second | Third
Annual cost of | Monthly | Renewal | Renewal | Renewal
Option No. One Monthly Original Cost/Sqg. | (p.s.f. - (p.s.f- (p.s.f- Cost for 4
(Supplies provided by Agency) cost |Contract Period Ft. mthly) mthly) mthly) Years
Rutherford Cleaning $540.00 $6,480.00 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1600 $20,016.00
Me & Mom Cleaning $600.00 $7,200.00 0.1667 0.1667 0.1667 0.1667 $28,800.00
Lomas CO”Str”CJt:;?tosreig‘l"ceS dbaLomas | ¢519 60 $2,635.20 00610 | 00610 | 00610 | 0.0610 | $8125.20
Brokate Janitorial $298.80 $3,585.60 0.0830 0.0830 0.0900 0.0900 $11,383.20
Resource Service Solutions $576.00 $6,912.00 0.1600 0.1600 0.1600 0.1600 $21,312.00
Super Shine Cleaning $900.00 $10,800.00 0.2500 0.2500 0.2700 0.2900 $34,308.00
Domestic Aide $864.00 $10,368.00 0.2400 0.2450 0.2500 0.2600 $32,688.00
Option No. 2
(Supplies provided by Contractor)
Rutherford Cleaning $684.00 $8,208.00 0.1900 0.1900 0.1900 0.2000 $25,344.00
Me & Mom Cleaning $0.00 $0.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $0.00
Lomas CO”S””";;?]?;?;‘I"CGS dbaLomas | g377 60 $3,931.20 00010 | 00910 | 00910 | 00910 | $12,121.20
Brokate Janitorial $396.00 $4,752.00 0.1100 0.1100 0.1200 0.1200 $15,120.00
Resource Service Solutions $612.00 $7,344.00 0.1700 0.1700 0.1700 0.1700 $22,644.00
Super Shine Cleaning $1,080.00 $12,960.00 0.3000 0.3000 0.3200 0.3500 $41,004.00
Domestic Aide $936.00 $11,232.00 0.2600 0.2650 0.2750 0.2900 $35,604.00




